

2023 Bid Item #	2023 Bid Item Description	QTY	UNIT	CITCO WATER	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG OR PART #	UNIT PRICE	CONSOLIDATED PIPE SUPPLY CO.	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG OR PART #	UNIT PRICE	CORE & MAIN	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG OR PART #	UNIT PRICE	FLORENCE WINWATER WORKS CO.	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG OR PART #	UNIT PRICE	J&S VALVE	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG OR PART #	UNIT PRICE	RAWDON MYERS INC.	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG OR PART #	UNIT PRICE	
																												MANUFACTURER
1	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	100	2100	ATM	ATM	5333-116	\$ 32.51	No Bid	AY McDonald	747018	\$ 31.95	FORD	F8600-3-NL	\$ 34.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	240	240	ATM	ATM	5333-122	\$ 44.23	No Bid	AY McDonald	747018	\$ 44.00	FORD	F8600-6-NL	\$ 44.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	36	36	ATM	ATM	5333-110	\$ 154.72	No Bid	AY McDonald	747018	\$ 154.17	FORD	F8600-6-NL	\$ 158.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	54	54	ATM	ATM	5333-107	\$ 152.03	No Bid	AY McDonald	747018	\$ 151.97	FORD	F8600-7-NL	\$ 158.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	618	618	ATM	ATM	5333-117	\$ 19.26	No Bid	AY McDonald	747765	\$ 19.15	FORD	L02-325-NL	\$ 19.89	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	160	160	ATM	ATM	5321-115	\$ 27.70	No Bid	AY McDonald	747765	\$ 27.50	FORD	L02-445-NL	\$ 28.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	25	25	ATM	ATM	5322-181	\$ 83.31	No Bid	AY McDonald	747765	\$ 79.89	FORD	L02-565-NL	\$ 81.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	25	25	ATM	ATM	5322-182	\$ 140.75	No Bid	AY McDonald	747765	\$ 140.00	FORD	L02-375-NL	\$ 145.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	600	600	ATM	ATM	5333-117	\$ 35.16	No Bid	AY McDonald	747018T	\$ 34.46	FORD	F81000-3-Q-NL	\$ 35.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	36	36	ATM	ATM	5333-114	\$ 46.71	No Bid	AY McDonald	747018T	\$ 46.46	FORD	F81000-4-Q-NL	\$ 47.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	20	20	ATM	ATM	5333-108	\$ 173.19	No Bid	AY McDonald	747018T	\$ 172.20	FORD	F81000-7-Q-NL	\$ 174.49	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	36	36	ATM	ATM	4128-108	\$ 20.70	No Bid	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 20.59	FORD	S70-303	\$ 21.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	16	16	ATM	ATM	4128-109	\$ 20.70	No Bid	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 20.59	FORD	S70-304	\$ 21.35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	10	10	ATM	ATM	4128-113	\$ 24.37	No Bid	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 24.23	FORD	S70-404	\$ 24.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	25	25	ATM	ATM	4148-002	\$ 68.17	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 68.41	FORD	2028-440-CC4	\$ 69.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	5	5	ATM	ATM	4148-024	\$ 80.89	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 80.67	FORD	2028-540-CC4	\$ 83.33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	5	5	ATM	ATM	4128-170	\$ 52.42	No Bid	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 52.14	FORD	S70-406	\$ 53.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	25	25	ATM	ATM	4148-004	\$ 88.17	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 87.70	FORD	2028-540-CC7	\$ 89.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	16	16	ATM	ATM	4128-116	\$ 36.31	No Bid	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 36.13	FORD	S70-803	\$ 37.79	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	35	35	ATM	ATM	4148-006	\$ 81.78	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 81.36	FORD	2028-750-CC3	\$ 82.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	250	250	ATM	ATM	4128-132	\$ 36.31	No Bid	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 35.94	FORD	S90-603	\$ 37.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	100	100	ATM	ATM	4128-133	\$ 36.31	No Bid	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 36.12	FORD	S90-604	\$ 37.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	10	10	ATM	ATM	4128-116	\$ 36.31	No Bid	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 36.12	FORD	S70-604	\$ 37.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	25	25	ATM	ATM	4148-008	\$ 81.78	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 81.35	FORD	2028-750-CC4	\$ 82.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
25	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	20	20	ATM	ATM	4128-153	\$ 68.54	No Bid	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 67.13	FORD	S90-607	\$ 70.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	16	16	ATM	ATM	4128-173	\$ 68.54	No Bid	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 68.19	FORD	S70-807	\$ 70.56	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	15	15	ATM	ATM	4148-010	\$ 102.74	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 102.20	FORD	2028-750-CC7	\$ 103.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	5	5	ATM	ATM	4148-012	\$ 102.74	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 102.20	FORD	2028-962-CC3	\$ 103.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
29	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	1000	1000	ATM	ATM	4128-134	\$ 48.91	No Bid	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 47.90	FORD	S90-803	\$ 51.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	100	100	ATM	ATM	4128-135	\$ 50.83	No Bid	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 50.58	FORD	S90-804	\$ 51.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
31	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	5	5	ATM	ATM	4148-014	\$ 101.24	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 100.05	FORD	2028-962-CC4	\$ 102.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
32	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	30	30	ATM	ATM	4128-126	\$ 49.91	No Bid	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 49.64	FORD	S70-804	\$ 51.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
33	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	30	30	ATM	ATM	4148-016	\$ 114.90	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 114.39	FORD	2028-962-CC7	\$ 117.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
34	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	20	20	ATM	ATM	4128-155	\$ 78.26	No Bid	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 77.86	FORD	S90-807	\$ 79.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
35	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	5	5	ATM	ATM	4128-175	\$ 70.88	No Bid	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 70.39	FORD	S70-807	\$ 72.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	5	5	ATM	ATM	4128-012	\$ 148.00	No Bid	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 147.22	FORD	S90-1203	\$ 155.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
37	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	6	6	ATM	ATM	4128-013	\$ 148.00	No Bid	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 147.22	FORD	S90-1204	\$ 155.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
38	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	5	5	ATM	ATM	4148-020	\$ 148.17	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 147.22	FORD	2028-1438-CC4	\$ 148.89	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
39	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	5	5	ATM	ATM	4148-022	\$ 166.90	No Bid	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 166.00	FORD	2028-1438-CC7	\$ 169.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
40	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	50	50	ATM	ATM	4148-020	\$ 36.31	No Bid	ford	ay5-603	\$ 36.98	FORD	S70-803	\$ 37.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
41	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	25	25	ATM	ATM	4148-044	\$ 36.31	No Bid	ford	ay5-603	\$ 36.98	FORD	S90-603	\$ 37.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
42	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	12	12	ATM	ATM	4148-046	\$ 36.31	No Bid	ford	ay5-604	\$ 36.98	FORD	S90-604	\$ 37.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
43	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	12	12	ATM	ATM	4148-022	\$ 36.31	No Bid	ford	ay5-604	\$ 36.98	FORD	S70-804	\$ 37.29	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
44	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	5	5	ATM	ATM	4148-050	\$ 68.54	No Bid	ford	ay5-607	\$ 69.77	FORD	S90-607	\$ 70.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
45	1" x 1/2" Copper Tee (Flare Ball Type)	5	5	ATM	ATM	4148-025	\$ 68.54	No Bid	ford	ay5-607	\$ 69.77	FORD	S70-807	\$ 70.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid											

Item #	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	STATUS	ALTERNATE	ALTERNATE PRICE	ALTERNATE STATUS	ALTERNATE TOTAL PRICE	STATUS	ALTERNATE	ALTERNATE PRICE	ALTERNATE STATUS	ALTERNATE TOTAL PRICE	
79	96	143	200	200	12" Metal Cover Heavy duty, each	AYM	74132 ARSTC	\$ 119.35		No Bid	AY McDonald	74132ARSTC	\$ 111.21		No Bid	No Bid	
79	96	143	2000	2000	12" Metal Cover (each read)	Vestal	32-369	\$ 58.67	Sigma	MB63CF7		\$ 58.67		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
80	96	100	100	100	Monitor Lid (One Hole)	SIGMA	10833	\$ 19.27	Sigma	MB63CF1	\$ 21.75	vestal	32-231	\$ 24.00	FORD	C3L7	\$ 26.90
81	99		20	20	Monitor Lid (Two Holes)	SIGMA	10879	\$ 23.93			No Bid	vestal	32-446	\$ 24.00	FORD	C3L7T	\$ 26.90
82	100	BCW	300	300	Composite Lid (One Hole)	Prosource	13718	\$ 79.81	Trumbull	367-5767 White	\$ 27.65	DFW	dw12hw-1w1_sml8id	\$ 28.99	FORD	C4.T	\$ 110.00
83	91		500	500	18" Ring and Lid Set	Vestal	32-223	\$ 11.91			No Bid	Vestal	32-223	\$ 12.10	FORD	C32.T	\$ 55.55
84	100	BCW	100	100	18" Composite Ring and Lid Set		No Bid		Trumbull	367-5459	\$ 55.00		No Bid	FORD	C32.T	\$ 55.55	No Bid
85	103		25	25	21" Ring and Lid Set	Vestal	32-294	\$ 41.56			No Bid	Vestal	32-294	\$ 42.20	FORD	C4	\$ 105.00
86	104	BCW	100	100	21" Ring Only	Vestal	32-092	\$ 43.33			No Bid	vestal	32-092	\$ 43.75	FORD	FC4	\$ 85.00
87	105	744	50	50	20" Monitor Lid and Ring	Vestal	32-478	\$ 181.41			No Bid	AY McDonald	746RLRG	\$ 231.27		No Bid	No Bid
88	106	737	50	110	18" x 24" Extension Ring	SIGMA	10815	\$ 31.25	Sigma	MBX7N1	\$ 88.00	AY McDonald	742X1	\$ 58.81	FORD	EXT-1	\$ 74.50
89	107	738	10	60	18" x 30" Extension Ring	SIGMA	10816	\$ 48.83	Sigma	MBX7N3	\$ 85.50	AY McDonald	747X3	\$ 111.60	FORD	EXT-3	\$ 125.50
90	108	739	40	40	20" x 24" Extension Ring (Monitor Cover Flange)	SIGMA	10839	\$ 14.72	Sigma	MBX7N2	\$ 89.00	AY McDonald	742F1000	\$ 70.57	FORD	FL-24	\$ 74.00
91	109	740	40	40	20" x 30" Extension Ring (Monitor Cover Flange)	SIGMA	10818	\$ 43.84	Sigma	MBX7N4	\$ 86.25	AY McDonald	742F1010	\$ 111.38	FORD	FL-30	\$ 128.80
92	110	303	250	10	3/4" Copper to Copper	AYM	5120-144	\$ 12.16			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758	\$ 12.17	FORD	C22-33-NL	\$ 12.88
93	111	307	20	10	3/4" x 1" Copper to Copper	AYM	5121-195	\$ 18.23			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758	\$ 18.22	FORD	C22-34-NL	\$ 18.99
94	112	386	20	20	3/4" Copper to 1/2" Iron (male)	AYM	5120-140	\$ 4.80			No Bid	AY McDonald	74753	\$ 4.80	FORD	C28-31-NL	\$ 9.99
95	113	11	20	10	1" Copper to Copper	AYM	5123-147	\$ 21.33			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758	\$ 21.33	FORD	C22-44-NL	\$ 22.22
96	114	23	25	25	1" Flare x 1/2" Copper Plugback	AYM	5120-024	\$ 14.73			No Bid	AY McDonald	74755	\$ 14.73	FORD	C02-43-NL	\$ 15.55
97	115	736	5	5	1-1/2" Copper to Copper 90	AYM	5122-165	\$ 31.08			No Bid	AY McDonald	74761	\$ 31.08	FORD	L22-66-NL	\$ 34.44
98	116	292	5	10	2" Copper to Copper 90	AYM	5122-171	\$ 120.52			No Bid	AY McDonald	74761	\$ 120.52	FORD	L22-77-NL	\$ 129.98
99	117	125	10	10	1-1/2" Copper to Copper	AYM	5122-147	\$ 40.30			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758	\$ 40.30	FORD	C22-66-NL	\$ 66.48
100	118	240	10	15	2" Copper to Copper	AYM	5122-146	\$ 104.49			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758	\$ 104.49	FORD	C22-77-NL	\$ 109.95
101	119	301	50	50	3/4" Copper x 1/2" FIP	AYM	5123-347	\$ 4.48			No Bid	AY McDonald	74754	\$ 4.48	FORD	C21-31-NL	\$ 8.88
102	120	306	50	50	3/4" Copper x 1" FIP	AYM	5123-095	\$ 12.72			No Bid	AY McDonald	74754	\$ 12.71	FORD	C21-34-NL	\$ 13.98
103	122	ND	500	10	5/8" Copper x 1" CTS Compression	AYM	5162-483	\$ 19.13			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758CT	\$ 18.83	FORD	C24-34-NL	\$ 19.61
104	123	305	100	100	3/4" Copper to Iron (male)	AYM	5120-139	\$ 3.94			No Bid	AY McDonald	74753	\$ 3.94	FORD	C28-32-NL	\$ 9.99
105	124	13	20	20	1" Copper to Iron (male)	AYM	5121-140	\$ 14.04			No Bid	AY McDonald	74753	\$ 14.04	FORD	C28-44-NL	\$ 14.98
106	126	127	75	75	1-1/2" Copper to Iron (male)	AYM	5122-140	\$ 43.31			No Bid	AY McDonald	74753	\$ 43.31	FORD	C28-66-NL	\$ 43.98
107	128	122	5	5	1-1/2" Compression to Iron (male)	AYM	5120-199	\$ 36.88			No Bid	AY McDonald	74757	\$ 35.87	FORD	C38-66-Q-NL	\$ 36.88
108	127	247	60	60	2" Copper to Iron (male)	AYM	5122-142	\$ 78.73			No Bid	AY McDonald	74753	\$ 78.72	FORD	C28-77-NL	\$ 79.99
109	128	303	5	5	2" Compression to Iron (male)	AYM	5123-105	\$ 123.28			No Bid	AY McDonald	74757	\$ 123.28	FORD	C34-77-Q-NL	\$ 133.31
110	129	304	30	30	3/4" Copper to Iron (female)	AYM	5120-141	\$ 9.72			No Bid	AY McDonald	74754	\$ 9.71	FORD	C21-33-NL	\$ 10.50
111	130	12	10	10	1" Copper to Iron (female)	AYM	5123-143	\$ 14.88			No Bid	AY McDonald	74754	\$ 14.87	FORD	C21-44-NL	\$ 15.99
112	131	36	100	10	1-1/2" Copper x Copper 90	AYM	5120-146	\$ 13.13			No Bid	AY McDonald	74761	\$ 13.12	FORD	L22-33-NL	\$ 14.55
113	132	136	10	10	1-1/2" Copper to Iron (female)	AYM	5122-143	\$ 39.40			No Bid	AY McDonald	74754	\$ 39.40	FORD	C21-66-NL	\$ 41.99
114	133	246	30	30	2" Copper to Iron (female)	AYM	5122-144	\$ 75.10			No Bid	AY McDonald	74754	\$ 75.10	FORD	C21-77-NL	\$ 77.77
115	134	303	1000	2000	3/4" Compression x Compression	AYM	5130-114	\$ 13.09			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758T	\$ 12.89	FORD	C44-33-Q-NL	\$ 13.47
116	135	9	100	100	1" Compression x Compression	AYM	5130-115	\$ 15.23			No Bid	AY McDonald	74757	\$ 15.23	FORD	C44-44-Q-NL	\$ 15.99
117	136	116	10	10	1-1/2" Compression to Compression	AYM	5131-105	\$ 51.54			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758T	\$ 51.54	FORD	C46-66-Q-NL	\$ 55.55
118	137	47	10	10	2" Compression x Compression	AYM	5131-108	\$ 68.24			No Bid	AY McDonald	74757	\$ 68.23	FORD	C44-77-Q-NL	\$ 71.99
119	138	134	20	20	1 1/2" Flare Nut x F.I.P.	AYM	5121-086	\$ 28.89			No Bid	AY McDonald	74757F	\$ 28.98	FORD	C21-66-NL	\$ 40.97
120	139	205	20	20	2" Flare Nut x F.I.P.	AYM	5121-080	\$ 49.40			No Bid	AY McDonald	74757F	\$ 49.49	FORD	C21-77-NL	\$ 76.47
121	140	84	10	10	1-1/2" Compression PVC x PVC	AYM	5123-203	\$ 85.17			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758-44	\$ 85.16	FORD	C77-66-NL	\$ 86.66
122	141	136	10	10	1-1/2" Compression PEP x CTS	AYM	9999-999	\$ 70.91			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758D-33	\$ 70.90	FORD	C46-66-NL	\$ 83.33
123	142	85	10	10	1-1/2" Compression PEP x PEP	AYM	5131-019	\$ 71.89			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758-33	\$ 71.89	FORD	D96-66-NL	\$ 74.44
124	143	83	10	10	1-1/2" Compression PVC x CTS	AYM	5123-354	\$ 70.33			No Bid	AY McDonald	74757-44	\$ 70.92	FORD	C47-66-NL	\$ 71.99
125	144	121	20	20	1-1/2" CTS Compression x PEP	AYM	5131-102	\$ 49.30			No Bid	AY McDonald	74747	\$ 49.30	FORD	C14-66-NL	\$ 49.49
126	145	80	10	10	2" Compression PVC x CTS	AYM	5123-380	\$ 82.00			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758T-44	\$ 82.00	FORD	C47-77-NL	\$ 84.44
127	146	73	10	10	2" Compression PVC x PVC	AYM	5123-103	\$ 96.86			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758-44	\$ 96.87	FORD	C77-77-NL	\$ 99.99
128	147	81	10	10	2" Compression PEP x PVC	AYM	5142-078	\$ 98.65			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758-33-44	\$ 98.65	FORD	C57-77-NL	\$ 94.44
129	148	74	10	10	2" Compression PEP x PEP	AYM	5131-030	\$ 97.72			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758-33	\$ 97.71	FORD	C66-77-NL	\$ 99.99
130	149	242	100	100	2" CTS Compression x FIP	AYM	5131-103	\$ 54.13			No Bid	AY McDonald	74757	\$ 54.12	FORD	C14-77-NL	\$ 54.99
131	150	905	50	50	5/8" Angle Valve x CTS Compression (Ball Type)	AYM	5146-174	\$ 33.48			No Bid	AY McDonald	7464EVP	\$ 33.47	FORD	BA21-333VAL	\$ 51.11
132	151	309	50	50	1/2" Copper Flare x 1" MBP	AYM	5121-187	\$ 11.32			No Bid	AY McDonald	74753	\$ 11.32	FORD	C28-34-NL	\$ 12.22
133	152	417	50	70	1-1/2" CTS Compression x 1" CTS Compression		No Bid			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758T	\$ 13.85	FORD	C44-34-Q-NL	\$ 16.66	
134	159	275	25	25	2" Slurry Lead (S) x 1" Flare Adapter	AYM	5190-008	\$ 43.16			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758C-66	\$ 43.15	FORD	C12-44-NL	\$ 44.44
135	160	82	25	25	1" One Gate Slurry Lead (OXS) x Flare Copper	AYM	5190-011	\$ 38.92			No Bid	AY McDonald	74758C-66	\$ 38.91	FORD	C32-44-NL	\$ 39.99
136	161	702	2000	2000	3/4" Dielectric Fittings	AYM	5121-018	\$ 23.00			No Bid	AY McDonald	74750DRL	\$ 22.89	FORD	SI-3NL	\$ 23.88
137	162	703	100	100	1" Dielectric Fittings	AYM	5121-020	\$ 34.48			No Bid	AY McDonald	74750DRL	\$ 34.48	FORD	SI-4NL	\$ 35.95
138	164	906	100	100	3/4" Female Copper Thread x 3/4" CTS Quik Joint	AYM	5182-009	\$ 12.09			No Bid	AY McDonald	74750D	\$ 12.09	FORD	E04-33-Q-NL	\$ 12.99
139	165	911	50	50	1" Female Copper Thread x 1" CTS Quik Joint	AYM	5182-076	\$ 19.50			No Bid	AY McDonald	74750D	\$ 19.50	FORD	E04-44-Q-NL	\$ 19.99
140	166	BCW	1500	1500	1" Solder End Connection - Compression x FIP	AYM	5130-116	\$ 11.41			No Bid	AY McDonald	74754T	\$ 11.40	FORD	C14-33-Q-NL	\$ 11.64
141	167	BCW	1500	1500	3/4" Solder End Connection - Compression x FIP	AYM	5130-141	\$ 9.72			No Bid	AY McDonald	74754	\$ 9.71	FORD	C21-33-NL	\$ 9.99
142	168	BCW	100	100	1" Solder End Connection - Compression x FIP	AYM	5130-117	\$ 15.77			No Bid	AY McDonald	74754T	\$ 15.77	FORD	C14-44-Q-NL	\$ 15.99
143	169	BCW	25	25	1" Solder End Connection - Flare x FIP	AYM	5121-143	\$ 14.88			No Bid	AY McDonald	74754	\$ 14.87	FORD	C21-44-NL	\$ 15.55
144	170	BCW	50	30	1" Solder End Connection - Compression x MBP	AYM	5131-100	\$ 12.28			No Bid	AY McDonald	74757T	\$ 12.28	FORD	C34-77-Q-NL	\$ 13.31
145	171	401	50	5	3/4" Ball Valve Flare X Flare	AYM	5129-161	\$ 49.81			No Bid						

Item #	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	ITEM #	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	ALTERNATE	MANUFACTURER	ITEM #	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	ALTERNATE	MANUFACTURER	ITEM #	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	ALTERNATE	MANUFACTURER	ITEM #	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	ALTERNATE				
137	183	252	10	18	2" Ball Valve LPX Flare	AYM	5129-120	\$ 210.89	No Bid	AY McDonald	76102	\$ -	210.89	FORD	B82-777-NL	\$ 249.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
138	184	253	55	36	2" Ball Valve (Inlets LPX)	AYM	5129-119	\$ 174.38	No Bid	AY McDonald	76101	\$ -	174.38	FORD	B11-777-NL	\$ 179.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
139	185	251	5	18	2" Ball Valve Copper x Copper	AYM	5129-118	\$ 271.88	No Bid	AY McDonald	76100	\$ -	271.88	FORD	B22-777-NL	\$ 279.58	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
140	186	BCW	10	18	ELBOW 3/4" (3/4" 90 BEND CTBACTS)	AYM	5129-105	\$ 17.40	No Bid	AY McDonald	747617	\$ -	17.40	FORD	L44-33-Q-NL	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
141	187	BCW	10	18	ELBOW 1" (1" 90 BEND CTBACTS)	AYM	5129-104	\$ 22.38	No Bid	AY McDonald	747617	\$ -	22.37	FORD	L44-44-Q-NL	\$ 23.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
142	188	BCW	5	9	ELBOW 2" (2" 90 BEND CTBACTS)	AYM	5129-105	\$ 142.45	No Bid	AY McDonald	747617	\$ -	142.44	FORD	L44-77-Q-NL	\$ 149.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
143	189	BCW	10	18	ELBOW 1" (1" 90 BEND CFXCF)	AYM	5129-105	\$ 22.05	No Bid	AY McDonald	74761	\$ -	22.05	FORD	L22-44-NL	\$ 23.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
144	190	BCW	20	28	CORP NUT 3/4" (3/4" ADPT CFXCF)	AYM	5149-189	\$ 12.99	No Bid	AY McDonald	747957	\$ -	12.99	FORD	C104-33-Q-NL	\$ 16.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
145	191	BCW	20	28	CORP NUT 1" (1" ADPT CFXCF)	AYM	5149-190	\$ 15.14	No Bid	AY McDonald	747957	\$ -	15.13	FORD	C104-44-Q-NL	\$ 21.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
146	192	BCW	20	28	CURBSTOP 3/4" (3/4" BALL CURB CTBACTS)	AYM	5129-109	\$ 48.88	No Bid	AY McDonald	761007	\$ -	48.88	FORD	B44-323-Q-NL	\$ 49.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
147	193	BCW	10	18	CURBSTOP 1" (1" BALL CURB CTBACTS)	AYM	5129-110	\$ 73.44	No Bid	AY McDonald	761007	\$ -	73.43	FORD	B44-444-Q-NL	\$ 75.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
148	194	BCW	10	18	CURBSTOP 2" (2" BALL CURB CTBACTS)	AYM	5131-108	\$ 244.70	No Bid	AY McDonald	761007	\$ -	244.50	FORD	B44-777-Q-NL	\$ 255.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
149	195	BCW	10	18	CURBSTOP 1" (1" BALL CURB CFXCF)	AYM	5129-102	\$ 67.89	No Bid	AY McDonald	76100	\$ -	67.69	FORD	B22-444-NL	\$ 69.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
150	196	BCW	100	190	3/4" Pressure Regulating Valve	ZURN	6000L	\$ 74.79	Wilkins	34-6000LLUSC	\$ 74.70	Wilkins	600H	\$ 73.92	WILKINS	34-6000LLUSC	\$ 76.89	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
151	197	BCW	24	34	1" Pressure Regulating Valve	ZURN	6000L	\$ 101.45	Wilkins	1-6000LLUSC	\$ 101.40	Wilkins	600H	\$ 99.03	WILKINS	1-6000LLUSC	\$ 105.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
152	198	411	450	56	486	1/4" High Range Pressure Regulating Valve	ZURN	6000R	\$ 66.36	Wilkins	34-6000RHLU	\$ 69.50	Wilkins	600H	\$ 68.94	WILKINS	34-6000RHLU	\$ 73.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
153	199	35	35	24	59	1" High Range Pressure Regulating Valve	ZURN	6000R	\$ 97.50	Wilkins	1-6000RHLU	\$ 99.80	Wilkins	600H	\$ 95.47	WILKINS	1-6000RHLU	\$ 114.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
154	200	147	5	9	1-1/2" Pressure Regulating Valve	ZURN	6000L	\$ 281.97	Wilkins	1-1/2-6000L	\$ 286.30	Wilkins	600H	\$ 279.99	WILKINS	1-5-6000L	\$ 313.22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
155	201	277	5	18	2" Pressure Regulating Valve	ZURN	6000L	\$ 364.28	Wilkins	2-6000L	\$ 368.70	Wilkins	600H	\$ 366.89	WILKINS	2-6000L	\$ 389.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
156	202	3	10	18	2" Air Release	CRISPM	PL-10	\$ 184.24	Crison	A113011PL10	\$ 233.00	No Bid	VALMATIC	38.5	\$ 220.00	No Bid	DaZURK, Inc.	MPV. 1.200A. T1. D1. R552	\$ 257.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
157	203	234	10	18	2" Air Release	CRISPM	PL-20	\$ 363.85	Crison	A113011PL20	\$ 460.00	No Bid	VALMATIC	38.6	\$ 355.00	No Bid	DaZURK, Inc.	MPV. 2.200A. T1. D1. R552	\$ 470.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
158	204	139	20	28	1-1/2" Meter Flanges (ast)	EDW	40535	\$ 11.38	No Bid	AY McDonald	7610F96	\$ 80.50	FORD	CF31-66-NL (2)	\$ 66.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
159	205	286	20	28	2" Meter Flanges (ast)	EDW	40537	\$ 85.95	No Bid	AY McDonald	7610F96	\$ 110.00	FORD	CF31-77-NL (2)	\$ 85.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
160	206	876	10	18	Eclipse 3/80 Auto Flushing Valve (2" inlet)	KUPFERLE	9400	\$ 2,286.29	Kupferle	Eclipse #9400	\$ 2,275.00	Kupferle	9400	\$ 2,254.48	KUPFERLE	600 AUTO FLUS	\$ 2,948.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
161	207	852	5	9	5" 4" Swamr Nozzle Hydrant Flange(s)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Mauler	#423	\$ 1,740.23	WATERLOUSIAFC	#B-67 or #B48	\$ 1,928.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
162	208	851	20	28	5" Fire Hydrant (2" 4" w/ Accessories)	KENEDY	K-81	\$ 1,826.80	No Bid	Mauler	#423	\$ 1,730.43	WATERLOUSIAFC	#B-67 or #B48	\$ 1,938.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
163	209	850	20	28	5" Fire Hydrant (4" 4" w/ Accessories)	KENEDY	K-81	\$ 1,889.84	Mauler	423-52964	\$ 1,797.00	Mauler	#423	\$ 1,781.93	WATERLOUSIAFC	#B-67 or #B48	\$ 1,950.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
164	210	858	20	28	5" Fire Hydrant (4" 4" w/ Accessories)	KENEDY	K-81	\$ 1,917.87	Mauler	423-53037	\$ 1,849.00	Mauler	#423	\$ 1,831.19	WATERLOUSIAFC	#B-67 or #B48	\$ 1,989.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
165	211	862	6	8	5" Fire Hydrant (2" 4" w/ Accessories)	KENEDY	K-81	\$ 1,959.70	Mauler	423-52943	\$ 1,891.00	Mauler	#423	\$ 1,872.41	WATERLOUSIAFC	#B-67 or #B48	\$ 2,050.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
166	212	863	6	8	5" Fire Hydrant (2" 4" w/ Accessories)	KENEDY	K-81	\$ 1,998.73	No Bid	Mauler	#423	\$ 1,878.63	WATERLOUSIAFC	#B-67 or #B48	\$ 2,098.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
167	213	751	225	50	275	Valve Box Complete Regular (Dry Ball)	SIGMA	VB562	\$ 42.71	Sigma	VB562	\$ 40.05	Star	562S	\$ 40.50	SIP	VB562	\$ 38.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
168	214	752	75	15	90	Valve Box Complete Regular (Dry Ball)	SIGMA	VB584	\$ 53.13	Sigma	VB584	\$ 53.95	Star	584S	\$ 49.99	SIP	VB584	\$ 59.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
169	New	75	75	75	Valve Box Complete Heavy Duty (Standard)	No Bid	No Bid	Sigma	VB62X	\$ 57.29	Star	562HD	\$ 54.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
170	New	28	28	28	Valve Box Complete Heavy Duty (Ball)	No Bid	No Bid	Sigma	VB284	\$ 62.74	Star	564HD	\$ 62.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
171	New	100	100	100	Valve Box Top, Heavy Duty	No Bid	No Bid	Sigma	VB621X	\$ 27.10	Star	167HD	\$ 25.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
172	638	20	10	38	Curb Box Complete	SIGMA	VB638	\$ 29.12	Sigma	VB760D	\$ 27.35	Star	93D	\$ 28.79	SIP	CB63-D	\$ 30.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
173	216	753	600	50	650	1" Valve Box Extension	SIGMA	VB201	\$ 6.32	Sigma	VB201-35	\$ 6.13	Star	VBX1	\$ 6.00	SIP	VB201	\$ 7.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
174	217	754	400	50	450	2" Valve Box Extension	SIGMA	VB202	\$ 8.22	Sigma	VB202-35	\$ 7.92	Star	VBX2	\$ 8.00	SIP	VB202	\$ 10.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
175	218	755	200	50	250	3" Valve Box Extension	SIGMA	VB203	\$ 11.90	Sigma	VB203-35	\$ 14.80	Star	VBX3	\$ 9.95	SIP	VB203	\$ 11.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
176	227	257	5	1	6	1" MJ Gate Valve	Kennedy	7571	\$ 265.92	Mauler	02A236225N	\$ 265.00	Mauler	#2362	\$ 256.92	AFC	2500	\$ 265.00	J&S Valve	GV-6902	\$ 194.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
177	228	323	5	1	8	1" MJ Gate Valve	Kennedy	7571	\$ 369.50	Mauler	03A236223N	\$ 369.50	Mauler	#2362	\$ 350.97	AFC	2500	\$ 360.00	J&S Valve	GV-6903	\$ 260.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
178	229	464	50	1	61	1" MJ Gate Valve	Kennedy	7571	\$ 414.75	Mauler	04A236223N	\$ 402.00	Mauler	#2361	\$ 401.08	AFC	2500	\$ 439.50	J&S Valve	GV-6904	\$ 340.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
179	230	530	150	12	152	1" MJ Gate Valve	Kennedy	7571	\$ 523.94	Mauler	06A236223N	\$ 521.00	Mauler	#2361	\$ 507.89	AFC	2500	\$ 539.00	J&S Valve	GV-6906	\$ 360.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
180	231	536	5	8	1" Flange X Flange Gate Valve	Kennedy	7561A	\$ 538.19	Mauler	08A236205N	\$ 530.00	Mauler	#2361	\$ 533.66	AFC	2500	\$ 559.00	J&S Valve	GV-6906	\$ 390.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
181	232	529	5	8	1" MJ X Flange Gate Valve	Kennedy	7572	\$ 524.11	Mauler	06A236118N	\$ 521.00	Mauler	#2361	\$ 514.51	AFC	2500	\$ 555.00	J&S Valve	GV-6906	\$ 360.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
182	233	597	10	12	62	1" MJ Gate Valve	Kennedy	7571	\$ 830.48	Mauler	08A236125N	\$ 823.00	Mauler	#2361	\$ 799.99	AFC	2500	\$ 879.50	J&S Valve	GV-6908	\$ 590.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
183	234	593	10	18	10" Gate Valve	Kennedy	7571	\$ 1,290.31	Mauler	10A236125N	\$ 1,280.00	Mauler	#2361	\$ 1,218.90	AFC	2500	\$ 1,377.52	J&S Valve	GV-6910	\$ 1,237.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
184	235	182	5	18	10" MJ Gate Valve	Kennedy	7571	\$ 1,620.38	Mauler	12A236123N	\$ 1,624.00	Mauler	#2361	\$ 1,598.67</													

Item #	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	PART #	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	STATUS	ALTERNATE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	STATUS	ALTERNATE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	STATUS	ALTERNATE			
234	267	780	5	1	6	1/2" PE Reducer w/ PE Reducer	SIGMA	PPR86	\$ 101.38	Sigma	PPR86	\$ 60.00	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
237	268	616	5	1	6	1/2" MJ w/ 1/2" MJ Reducer w/ Accessories	SIGMA	DMR66	\$ 36.07	Sigma	DMR66	\$ 90.00	No Bid	SIP	FMRMJ080K	\$ 87.00	No Bid		No Bid	
238	269	734	5	1	6	1/2" PE Reducer w/ PE Reducer w/ Accessories	SIGMA	PPR126	\$ 141.10	Sigma	PPR126	\$ 118.00	No Bid				No Bid		No Bid	
239	270	237	5	1	6	1/2" MJ w/ 1/2" MJ Reducer w/ Accessories	SIGMA	DMR126	\$ 114.00	Sigma	DMR126	\$ 130.00	No Bid	SIP	FMRMJ120K	\$ 130.00	No Bid		No Bid	
240	291	493	10	19	19	1/2" Solid Sleeve w/ Accessories	SIGMA	DML4	\$ 56.81	Sigma	DML4	\$ 50.00	No Bid	SIP	FMSDK4	\$ 58.00	No Bid		No Bid	
241	302	508	10	5	19	1/2" Solid Sleeve w/ Accessories	SIGMA	DML8	\$ 88.11	Sigma	DML8	\$ 76.00	No Bid	SIP	FMSDK8	\$ 83.00	No Bid		No Bid	
242	295	611	10	6	16	1/2" Solid Sleeve w/ Accessories	SIGMA	DML8	\$ 124.52	Sigma	DML8	\$ 120.00	No Bid	SIP	FMSDK8	\$ 128.00	No Bid		No Bid	
243	294	102	5	4	9	1/2" Solid Sleeve w/ Accessories	SIGMA	DML12	\$ 195.96	Sigma	DML12	\$ 182.00	No Bid	SIP	FMS12K	\$ 205.00	No Bid		No Bid	
244	295	331	5	2	7	2" Solid Sleeve w/ Accessories	SIGMA	DML20	\$ 989.24	Sigma	DML20	\$ 960.00	No Bid				No Bid		No Bid	
245	306	475	10	19	19	1/2" MJ Plug w/ Accessories	SIGMA	DMP4	\$ 29.38	Sigma	DMP4	\$ 27.00	No Bid	SIP	FMP4K	\$ 25.50	No Bid		No Bid	
246	309	545	10	19	19	1/2" MJ Plug w/ Accessories	SIGMA	DMP6	\$ 48.39	Sigma	DMP6	\$ 46.00	No Bid	SIP	FMP6K	\$ 39.00	No Bid		No Bid	
247	310	599	10	19	19	1/2" MJ Plug w/ Accessories	SIGMA	10560	\$ 44.34	Sigma	DMP6	\$ 42.00	No Bid	SIP	FMP6K	\$ 42.00	No Bid		No Bid	
248	311	100	10	19	19	1/2" MJ Plug w/ Accessories	SIGMA	10566	\$ 76.31	Sigma	DMPT2	\$ 103.00	No Bid	SIP	FMP12K	\$ 98.00	No Bid		No Bid	
249	312	473	10	19	19	1/2" MJ Caps w/ Accessories	SIGMA	10433	\$ 12.72	Sigma	DMK4	\$ 27.00	No Bid	SIP	FMC4K	\$ 26.00	No Bid		No Bid	
250	313	543	10	19	19	1/2" MJ Caps w/ Accessories	SIGMA	10547	\$ 22.89	Sigma	DMK6	\$ 43.00	No Bid	SIP	FMC6K	\$ 39.00	No Bid		No Bid	
251	314	597	10	19	19	1/2" MJ Caps w/ Accessories	SIGMA	10549	\$ 37.13	Sigma	DMK6	\$ 61.00	No Bid	SIP	FMC6K	\$ 59.00	No Bid		No Bid	
252	315	187	10	19	19	1/2" MJ Caps w/ Accessories	SIGMA	10435	\$ 63.44	Sigma	DMK12	\$ 107.00	No Bid	SIP	FMC12K	\$ 99.00	No Bid		No Bid	
253	216	BCW	20	20	20	1/4" Repair Clamp w/ 1" Long	POWERSEAL	3152	\$ 38.36	FORD	FSC-088-6R2	\$ 28.50	Invd	Inv-088-6r	\$ 23.89	FORD	FSC-088-6R2	\$ 28.88	No Bid	No Bid
254	217	BCW	20	20	20	1/4" Repair Clamp w/ 1" Long	POWERSEAL	3152	\$ 36.74	FORD	FSC-113-6R2	\$ 26.79	Invd	Inv-113-6r	\$ 23.96	FORD	FSC-113-6R2	\$ 26.99	No Bid	No Bid
255	218	BCW	400	400	400	1/4" Repair Clamp w/ 3" Long	POWERSEAL	3152	\$ 31.72	FORD	FSC-088-3R2	\$ 12.98	Invd	Inv-088-3r	\$ 11.29	FORD	FSC-088-3R2	\$ 12.98	No Bid	No Bid
256	219	BCW	100	100	100	1/4" Repair Clamp w/ 3" Long	POWERSEAL	3152	\$ 34.13	FORD	FSC-113-3R2	\$ 13.45	Invd	Inv-113-3r	\$ 11.91	FORD	FSC-113-3R2	\$ 13.88	No Bid	No Bid
257	320	282	5	4	9	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long w/1" (O.D. 2.38 - 2.63)	POWERSEAL	3121020120CA	\$ 61.42	FORD	FS1-263-125-CC4	\$ 47.85	No Bid	FORD	FS1-263-125-CC	\$ 65.55	No Bid		No Bid	
258	321	280	10	2	12	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 2.38 - 2.63)	POWERSEAL	3121020120CA	\$ 47.85	FORD	FS1-263-125	\$ 51.72	No Bid	FORD	FS1-263-125	\$ 48.95	No Bid		No Bid	
259	324	372	5	5	5	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long w/1" (O.D. 2.38 - 2.63)	POWERSEAL	3130301200CD	\$ 72.05	FORD	FS1-400-125-CC4	\$ 80.00	No Bid	FORD	FS1-400-125-CC	\$ 76.65	No Bid		No Bid	
260	327	371	10	10	10	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 1.73 - 4.05)	POWERSEAL	3121030120CA	\$ 59.95	FORD	FS1-400-125	\$ 57.00	No Bid	FORD	FS1-400-125	\$ 55.50	No Bid		No Bid	
261	328	369	10	10	10	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 1.66 - 3.79)	POWERSEAL	3121048030CA	\$ 57.85	FORD	FS1-376-125	\$ 56.99	No Bid	FORD	FS1-376-125	\$ 55.50	No Bid		No Bid	
262	328	601	20	20	20	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 7.5" Long (O.D. 1.22 - 3.62)	POWERSEAL	3121048030CA	\$ 48.76	FORD	FS1-162-75	\$ 48.42	No Bid	FORD	FS1-161-7.5	\$ 48.48	No Bid		No Bid	
263	331	487	100	100	100	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 4.74 - 5.16)	POWERSEAL	3121048030CA	\$ 58.44	FORD	FS1-514-75	\$ 48.80	No Bid	FORD	FS1-514-12.5	\$ 69.50	No Bid		No Bid	
264	332	481	20	20	20	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 3.22 - 6.02)	POWERSEAL	3121048030CA	\$ 53.33	FORD	FS1-561-125	\$ 70.89	No Bid	FORD	FS1-561-12.5	\$ 69.93	No Bid		No Bid	
265	333	483	20	20	20	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 1.74 x 5.14 w/ 1" top leg)	POWERSEAL	3121048120CD	\$ 89.43	FORD	FS1-614-125-CC4	\$ 96.45	No Bid	FORD	FS1-614-125-CC	\$ 92.50	No Bid		No Bid	
266	334	480	10	10	10	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 1.22 - 3.62 w/ 1" top leg)	POWERSEAL	3121048030CA	\$ 80.43	FORD	FS1-561-125-CC4	\$ 96.45	No Bid	FORD	FS1-561-125-CC	\$ 92.50	No Bid		No Bid	
267	335	484	5	5	5	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 1.74 x 5.14 w/ 2" top leg)	POWERSEAL	3121048030CA	\$ 91.39	FORD	FS1-614-125-CC7	\$ 92.25	No Bid	FORD	FS1-614-125-CC	\$ 95.50	No Bid		No Bid	
268	336	486	20	20	20	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 20" Long (O.D. 1.74 x 5.14)	POWERSEAL	3121048030CA	\$ 103.20	FORD	FS1-514-20	\$ 118.00	No Bid	FORD	FS1-614-20	\$ 115.00	No Bid		No Bid	
269	337	487	5	4	4	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 24" Long (O.D. 1.74 x 5.14)	POWERSEAL	312104804CA	\$ 129.76	FORD	FS1-614-24	\$ 139.00	No Bid	FORD	FS1-614-24	\$ 139.00	No Bid		No Bid	
270	340	561	100	100	100	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 7.5" Long (O.D. 1.64 - 7.24)	POWERSEAL	312106030CA	\$ 59.37	FORD	FS1-724-75	\$ 56.95	No Bid	FORD	FS1-740-7.5	\$ 55.55	No Bid		No Bid	
271	340	568	300	3	303	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 1.74 - 7.24)	POWERSEAL	312106030CA	\$ 74.28	FORD	FS1-724-125	\$ 74.28	No Bid	FORD	FS1-724-12.5	\$ 74.44	No Bid		No Bid	
272	341	566	10	3	13	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 1.68 - 7.40)	POWERSEAL	3121060120CA	\$ 73.69	FORD	FS1-745-125	\$ 75.00	No Bid	FORD	FS1-745-12.5	\$ 74.44	No Bid		No Bid	
273	342	566	25	25	25	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 1.64 x 1.24 w/ 1" top leg)	POWERSEAL	3130601200CD	\$ 85.71	FORD	FS1-724-125-CC4	\$ 97.35	No Bid	FORD	FS1-724-125-CC	\$ 95.00	No Bid		No Bid	
274	343	569	40	1	40	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 20" Long (O.D. 1.64 - 7.24)	POWERSEAL	312106020CA	\$ 140.46	FORD	FS1-724-20	\$ 138.30	No Bid	FORD	FS1-724-20	\$ 129.00	No Bid		No Bid	
275	344	560	25	1	26	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 24" Long (O.D. 1.64 - 7.24)	POWERSEAL	312106024CA	\$ 165.31	FORD	FS1-724-24	\$ 164.00	No Bid	FORD	FS1-724-24	\$ 172.00	No Bid		No Bid	
276	345	567	5	4	4	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long w/1" top leg (O.D. 1.64 - 7.24)	POWERSEAL	3121060120CD	\$ 107.92	FORD	FS1-724-125-CC7	\$ 111.00	No Bid	FORD	FS1-724-125-CC	\$ 110.00	No Bid		No Bid	
277	347	608	50	3	53	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 1.69 - 9.39)	POWERSEAL	3121060120CA	\$ 85.92	FORD	FS1-839-125	\$ 89.00	No Bid	FORD	FS1-839-12.5	\$ 85.00	No Bid		No Bid	
278	348	609	10	1	11	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 20" Long (O.D. 1.69 - 9.39)	POWERSEAL	312106020CA	\$ 169.91	FORD	FS1-839-20	\$ 147.81	No Bid	FORD	FS1-839-20	\$ 139.00	No Bid		No Bid	
279	349	610	5	1	6	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 24" Long (O.D. 1.69 - 9.39)	POWERSEAL	312106024CA	\$ 179.47	FORD	FS1-839-24	\$ 184.00	No Bid	FORD	FS1-839-24	\$ 175.00	No Bid		No Bid	
280	350	612	5	1	6	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 30" Long (O.D. 1.69 - 9.39)	POWERSEAL	312106030CA	\$ 221.88	FORD	FS1-839-30	\$ 216.00	No Bid	FORD	FS1-839-30	\$ 215.00	No Bid		No Bid	
281	351	606	10	10	10	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 1" Long (O.D. 1.69 - 9.39)	POWERSEAL	3130601200CD	\$ 139.99	FORD	FS1-839-125-CC4	\$ 110.10	No Bid	FORD	FS1-839-125-CC	\$ 110.00	No Bid		No Bid	
282	352	605	5	5	5	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long w/1" top leg (O.D. 1.69 - 9.39)	POWERSEAL	3130601200CD	\$ 117.33	FORD	FS1-839-125-CC7	\$ 121.15	No Bid	FORD	FS1-839-125-CC	\$ 119.00	No Bid		No Bid	
283	353	38	20	20	20	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 11.60 - 11.40)	POWERSEAL	31210120CA	\$ 69.79	FORD	FS1-144-120	\$ 119.52	No Bid	FORD	FS1-144-12.5	\$ 110.00	No Bid		No Bid	
284	354	100	25	3	28	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 13.15 - 13.50)	POWERSEAL	31212120CA	\$ 108.67	FORD	FS1-150-125	\$ 138.52	No Bid	FORD	FS1-150-12.5	\$ 138.00	No Bid		No Bid	
285	355	849	10	1	11	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long HIGH PRESSURE (O.D. 13.15 - 13.50)	POWERSEAL	31221280CA-HP	\$ 339.20	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
286	356	183	20	20	20	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 18" Long (O.D. 13.15 - 13.50)	POWERSEAL	31212120CA	\$ 143.75	FORD	FS1-150-15	\$ 156.00	No Bid				No Bid		No Bid	
287	357	183	5	5	5	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 18" Long HIGH PRESSURE (O.D. 13.15 - 13.50)	POWERSEAL	31221280CA-HP	\$ 461.39	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
288	358	191	10	10	10	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 20" Long (O.D. 13.15 - 13.50)	POWERSEAL	31212220CA	\$ 190.99	FORD	FS1-150-15	\$ 218.52	No Bid	FORD	FS1-150-20	\$ 216.00	No Bid		No Bid	
289	359	851	5	5	5	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 12" Long (O.D. 13.30)	POWERSEAL	31214120CA	\$ 148.08	FORD	FS2-150-125	\$ 201.51	No Bid	FORD	FS2-150-12.5	\$ 225.00	No Bid		No Bid	
290	360	852	5	4	4	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 20" Long (O.D. 21.60 - 22.00)	POWERSEAL	31217820CA	\$ 319.99	FORD	FS2-170-20	\$ 361.00	No Bid	FORD	FS2-170-20	\$ 349.00	No Bid		No Bid	
291	361	218	5	5	5	1/2" Repair Clamp w/ 30" Long HIGH PRESSURE (O.D. 17.35 - 17.60)	POWERSEAL	31221800CA-HP	\$ 562.75	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
292	362	853	5	5	5	2" Repair Clamp w/ 18" Long HIGH PRESSURE (O.D. 21.60)	POWERSEAL	31222240CA-HP	\$ 761.28	Hymax	880-56-0487-16P	\$ 1,910.00	No Bid				No Bid		No Bid	
293	363	330	5	5	5	2" Repair Clamp														

