

**Bid Opening for
NORTHERN KENTUCKY WATER DISTRICT
Fort Thomas Treatment Plant Raw Water Reservoir Solids Removal
July 30, 2020
2:00 p.m.**

Company	Bid Bond	Add #1	Add #2	Total Base Bid Cost	Total Alternate 1 Bid Cost	Total Alternate 2 Bid Cost	Total Alternate 3 Bid Cost
<u>Hepaco LLC</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>\$ 4,994,500.00</u>	<u>\$ 3,877,325.00</u>	<u>\$ 1,565,000.00</u>	<u>\$ 1,228,525.00</u>
<u>Metropolitan Environmental Services Inc.</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>\$ 6,987,015.00</u>	<u>\$ 4,837,900.00</u>	<u>\$ 2,167,500.00</u>	<u>\$ 1,520,400.00</u>
<u>Petro Environmental LLC</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>\$ 5,547,200.00</u>	<u>\$ 5,022,200.00</u>	<u>\$ 1,830,600.00</u>	<u>\$ 1,719,600.00</u>
<u>Gallenstein Companies LLC</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>\$ 9,430,000.00</u>	<u>\$ 8,997,000.00</u>	<u>\$ 2,814,000.00</u>	<u>\$ 2,684,100.00</u>
<u>Homrich</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>\$ 7,613,000.00</u>	<u>No Bid</u>	<u>\$ 2,359,000.00</u>	<u>No Bid</u>
<u>Veit and Company Inc</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>Yes</u>	<u>\$ 6,475,000.00</u>	<u>No Bid</u>	<u>\$ 2,025,000.00</u>	<u>No Bid</u>
<u> </u>							
<u> </u>							