

NORTHERN KENTUCKY WATER DISTRICT & BOONE COUNTY WATER DISTRICT

Cold Water Meter Bid Opening

Tuesday, February 23, 2021

11:00AM

PART A - NORTHERN KENTUCKY WATER DISTRICT

		Badger Meter, Inc.	Ferguson Enterprises, LLC	Neptune Equipment Company	Florence Winwater Works Co.	Citco Water
Est Qty	Item	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
7,500	5/8"x 1/2" PD Meter *	\$ 70.33	\$ 71.29	\$ 73.26	no bid	\$ 107.44
1,000	5/8"x 1/2" Ultrasonic Meter	\$ 134.72	no bid	\$ 131.18	\$ 90.33	\$ 97.36
1,000	5/8"x 3/4" PD Meter *	\$ 70.33	\$ 71.29	\$ 73.26	no bid	\$ 107.44
500	5/8"x 3/4" Ultrasonic Meter	\$ 134.72	no bid	\$ 131.18	\$ 92.13	\$ 97.36
100	1" PD Meter *	\$ 114.96	\$ 116.96	\$ 173.91	no bid	\$ 177.20
100	1" Ultrasonic Meter	\$ 174.40	no bid	\$ 192.31	\$ 117.17	\$ 141.06
50	1 1/2" PD Meter (Oval Flanged)	\$ 283.38	\$ 285.38	\$ 416.67	no bid	\$ 396.20
50	1 1/2" Ultrasonic Meter (Oval Flanged)	\$ 415.36	\$ 1,853.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 240.00	\$ 3,680.25
50	2" PD Meter (Oval Flanged)	\$ 384.83	\$ 386.33	\$ 516.67	no bid	\$ 560.05
50	2" Ultrasonic Meter (Oval Flanged)	\$ 559.36	\$ 1,918.00	\$ 611.11	no bid	\$ 3,852.75
25	3" Ultrasonic Meter	\$ 1,456.00	\$ 2,553.00	\$ 1,894.00	\$ 995.00	\$ 4,025.25
25	4" Ultrasonic Meter	\$ 1,776.00	\$ 3,960.00	\$ 2,433.33	\$ 1,105.00	\$ 4,370.25
5	6" Ultrasonic Meter	\$ 2,975.00	\$ 6,320.00	\$ 4,122.22	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 4,715.25
3	8" Ultrasonic Meter	\$ 3,675.00	\$ 7,960.00	no bid	\$ 1,950.00	\$ 5,474.25