

## BID TAB

### Northern Kentucky Water District Aggregate Materials for 2017

March 29, 2017

<u>Items</u>	<u>Martin Marietta</u> (unit prices)	<u>Ideal Supplies, Inc.</u> (unit prices)	<u>James T Chambers Trucking LLC</u> (unit prices)	<u>Bray Trucking Inc.</u> (unit prices)
#2 Limestone (250 tons)	no bid	\$17.10	\$15.35	\$14.20
#57 Limestone (1500 tons)	no bid	\$17.10	\$16.05	\$14.31
#304 Limestone (200 tons)	\$11.00	\$17.10	\$14.60	\$13.40
#610 Limestone (10 tons)	no bid	\$17.10	no bid	\$13.40
Backfill Sand (2500 tons)	\$5.50	\$13.20	\$10.25	\$9.40
Winter Asph. Mix (200 tons) (cold patch)	no bid	no bid	\$70.00	\$120.00
TOTAL BID (based on est. quantities)	<b>\$15,950.00</b>	<b>\$66,516.00</b>	<b>\$70,457.50</b>	<b>\$75,329.00</b>