Bid Tab
Northern Kentucky Water District
District Vehicle 2018 Bid

April 3, 2018
11:00 AM

UNIT PRICE SCHEDULE (Includes unit price per item- for more details and exceptions, see full bid sheet)

Number of Units 1 2 1 1 2 3 1

Medium Duty 1-1/2 Ton Heavy ¥ Ton Heavy |Compact (4 x 4)

Service Truck with . ¥ Ton Heavy
1,
20-Ton Canopy Top Utility D“‘Y _Serwce Tr.uck puty (4x4) or /2 Ton (4 x 4) Duty (4 x 4) | Mid-Size Sedan, 4-
. Utility Body with Pickup Truck Pickup Truck -
Equipment Drag | Body and Under . . Pickup Truck Door
. Crane and Under with Extended | with Extended | . o
Deck Air . with Utility Body
Deck Air Compressor Cab Cab
Company Compressor
No Bid No Bid No Bid S 33,180.00 | $ 26,686.00 | S 39,726.00 | $ 17,910.00
Crossroads Ford
No Bid S 77,153.70 | $§ 88,893.00 | S 32,294.00 | $ 28,215.00 | $ 43,018.00 | S 17,991.00
Fuller Ford
Ditch Witch S 20,998.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cruze- $17,324.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid 32,512.00 28,810.00 No Bid )
McCluskey Chevrolet oF o= e > > e Malibu- $19,365.00
. S 21,490.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Southeastern Equipment Co., Inc.
. i No Bid S 94,981.00 | $ 100,981.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fyda Freightliner
No Bid Gas-$70,281.00 | Gas- 38511500 Diesel « 3319109 | s 219500 | $ 44,4400 | $ 18,594.00
Haag Ford Diesel- $77,970.00 $92,354.00
No Bi No Bi No Bi No Bi 24 . No Bi No Bi
Tim Short- Chevy, Dodge, Jeep, Ram o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid S ,856.00 o Bid o Bid
Tim Short- Chevrolet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 18,265.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid S 44,989.00 | S 27,146.00 | $ 40,624.00 | S 20,261.00

Tim Short- Ford




