

Bid Tab
Northern Kentucky Water District
District Vehicle 2016 Bid

March 24, 2017
11:00 AM

UNIT PRICE SCHEDULE (Includes unit price per item- for more details see full bid sheet)										
Company	3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH COVERED UTILITY BODY	COMPACT 4X2 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	COMPACT 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	20-TON EQUIPMENT DRAG	2500 CARGO VAN	TANDEM DUMP TRUCK	DUMP TRUCK - CAB & CHASSIS WITH DUMP BED	MEDIUM DUTY SERVICE TRUCK WITH CANOPY TOP UTILITY BODY AND 160 C.F.M. UNDER DECK AIR COMPRESSOR	BACKHOE/LOADER
McCluskey Chevrolet	\$ 32,075.00	\$ 41,384.00	\$23,699.00/\$25,318.00	\$27,563.00/\$28,199.00	no bid	\$ 31,435.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Tim Short Auto Group	\$ 30,474.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Haag Ford Sale	\$ 33,724.00	\$ 44,242.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 77,546.00	no bid
Kenworth of Cincinnati	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 113,571.00	\$ 101,200.00	no bid	no bid
Fyda Freightliner	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 103,719.00	\$ 90,291.00	\$ 94,996.00	no bid
Southeastern Equipment Co., Inc.	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 21,000.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 96,340.00
Fuller Ford	\$ 30,543.50	\$ 38,363.50	\$ 23,292.50	\$ 26,280.50	no bid	\$ 28,727.50	no bid	no bid	\$ 76,402.50	no bid

Bid Tab
Northern Kentucky Water District
District Vehicle 2016 Bid

March 24, 2017
11:00 AM

Southeastern Equipment Co., Inc.	Qty.	Make	Model	Unit Cost	Total Cost
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH COVERED UTILITY BODY	1			no bid	
COMPACT 4X2 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
COMPACT 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
20-TON EQUIPMENT DRAG	1	Eager-Beaver	20XPT	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 21,000.00
2500 CARGO VAN	2			no bid	
TANDEM DUMP TRUCK	1			no bid	
DUMP TRUCK - CAB & CHASSIS WITH DUMP BED	1			no bid	
MEDIUM DUTY SERVICE TRUCK WITH CANOPY TOP UTILITY BODY AND 160 C.F.M. UNDER DECK AIR COMPRESSOR	1			no bid	
BACKHOE/LOADER	1	Case	580 SN	\$ 96,340.00	\$ 96,340.00

1982 Florence Pike, Burlington, KY 41005 (Jerry Rice 859-512-4767)

60 days after bid opening

Fuller Ford	Qty.	Make	Model	Unit Cost	Total Cost
--------------------	------	------	-------	-----------	------------

3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1	Ford	F250 SC	\$ 30,543.50	\$ 30,543.50
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH COVERED UTILITY BODY	1	Ford	F250 Req Cab	\$ 38,363.50	\$ 38,363.50
COMPACT 4X2 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1	Ford	F150 SC	\$ 23,292.50	\$ 23,292.50
COMPACT 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1	Ford	F150 SC	\$ 26,280.50	\$ 26,280.50
20-TON EQUIPMENT DRAG	1			no bid	
2500 CARGO VAN	2	Ford	Transit	\$ 28,727.50	\$ 57,455.00
TANDEM DUMP TRUCK	1			no bid	
DUMP TRUCK - CAB & CHASSIS WITH DUMP BED	1			no bid	
MEDIUM DUTY SERVICE TRUCK WITH CANOPY TOP UTILITY BODY AND 160 C.F.M. UNDER DECK AIR COMPRESSOR	1	Ford	F550 Utility	\$ 76,402.50	\$ 76,402.50
BACKHOE/LOADER	1			no bid	

900 W 8th Street, Cincinnati, OH 45203 (Mike Simpson/
Steve Hayhow)

90-240 days after bid opening

Fyda Freightliner Cincinnati, Inc.	Qty.	Make	Model	Unit Cost	Total Cost
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH COVERED UTILITY BODY	1			no bid	
COMPACT 4X2 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
COMPACT 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
20-TON EQUIPMENT DRAG	1			no bid	

2500 CARGO VAN	2			no bid	
TANDEM DUMP TRUCK	1	Freightliner	M2-106	\$ 103,719.00	\$ 103,719.00
DUMP TRUCK - CAB & CHASSIS WITH DUMP BED	1	Freightliner	M2-106	\$ 90,291.00	\$ 90,291.00
MEDIUM DUTY SERVICE TRUCK WITH CANOPY TOP UTILITY BODY AND 160 C.F.M. UNDER DECK AIR COMPRESSOR	1	Freightliner	M2-106	\$ 94,996.00	\$ 94,996.00
BACKHOE/LOADER	1			no bid	

1 Freightliner Dr, Cincinnati, OH 45241 (Mike Bailey)

170 days after bid opening

Haag Ford Sales	Qty.	Make	Model	Unit Cost	Total Cost
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1	Ford	F250, 4x4	\$ 33,724.00	\$ 33,724.00
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH COVERED UTILITY BODY	1	Ford	F250, 4x4	\$ 44,242.00	\$ 44,242.00
COMPACT 4X2 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
COMPACT 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
20-TON EQUIPMENT DRAG	1			no bid	
2500 CARGO VAN	2			no bid	
TANDEM DUMP TRUCK	1			no bid	
DUMP TRUCK - CAB & CHASSIS WITH DUMP BED	1			no bid	
MEDIUM DUTY SERVICE TRUCK WITH CANOPY TOP UTILITY BODY AND 160 C.F.M. UNDER DECK AIR COMPRESSOR	1	Ford	F550	\$ 77,546.00	\$ 77,546.00
BACKHOE/LOADER	1			no bid	

405 E Eads Parkway, Lawrenchburg, IN, 47025 (Steve
Caldwell 812-537-3000)

120 days after bid opening

Kenworth of Cincinnati	Qty.	Make	Model	Unit Cost	Total Cost
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH COVERED UTILITY BODY	1			no bid	
COMPACT 4X2 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
COMPACT 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
20-TON EQUIPMENT DRAG	1			no bid	
2500 CARGO VAN	2			no bid	
TANDEM DUMP TRUCK	1	Kenworth	T370	\$ 113,571.00	\$ 113,571.00
DUMP TRUCK - CAB & CHASSIS WITH DUMP BED	1	Kenworth	T370	\$ 101,200.00	\$ 101,200.00
MEDIUM DUTY SERVICE TRUCK WITH CANOPY TOP UTILITY BODY AND 160 C.F.M. UNDER DECK AIR COMPRESSOR	1			no bid	
BACKHOE/LOADER	1			no bid	

65 Partnership Way, Cincinnati, OH 45241 (Ken Townley
513-699-1862)

165 days after bid opening

Tim Short CDJR	Qty.	Make	Model	Unit Cost	Total Cost
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1	Ram	\$ 250.00	\$ 30,474.00	\$ 30,474.00
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH COVERED UTILITY BODY	1			no bid	

COMPACT 4X2 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
COMPACT 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1			no bid	
20-TON EQUIPMENT DRAG	1			no bid	
2500 CARGO VAN	2			no bid	
TANDEM DUMP TRUCK	1			no bid	
DUMP TRUCK - CAB & CHASSIS WITH DUMP BED	1			no bid	
MEDIUM DUTY SERVICE TRUCK WITH CANOPY TOP UTILITY BODY AND 160 C.F.M. UNDER DECK AIR COMPRESSOR	1			no bid	
BACKHOE/LOADER	1			no bid	

P.O. Box 1104, Morehead, KY 40351 (Ron Blackburn 859-351-1752)

90-100 days after bid opening

McCluskey Chevrolet, Inc.	Qty.	Make	Model	Unit Cost	Total Cost
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1	Chevrolet	Silverado 2500 HD	\$ 32,075.00	\$ 32,075.00
3 / 4 TON HEAVY DUTY (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK WITH COVERED UTILITY BODY	1	Chevrolet	Silverado 2500 HD	\$ 41,384.00	\$ 41,384.00
COMPACT 4X2 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1	Chevrolet	Colorado	\$ 23,699.00	\$ 23,699.00
	1	Chevrolet	Silverado 1500	\$ 25,318.00	\$ 25,318.00
COMPACT 4X4 PICKUP TRUCK WITH EXTENDED CAB	1	Chevrolet	Colorado	\$ 27,563.00	\$ 27,563.00
	1	Chevrolet	Silverado 1500	\$ 28,199.00	\$ 28,199.00
20-TON EQUIPMENT DRAG	1			no bid	

2500 CARGO VAN	2	Chevrolet	Express 2500	\$ 31,435.00	\$ 62,870.00
TANDEM DUMP TRUCK	1			no bid	
DUMP TRUCK - CAB & CHASSIS WITH DUMP BED	1			no bid	
MEDIUM DUTY SERVICE TRUCK WITH CANOPY TOP UTILITY BODY AND 160 C.F.M. UNDER DECK AIR COMPRESSOR	1			no bid	
BACKHOE/LOADER	1			no bid	

9673 Kings Automall Road, Cincinnati, OH 45249 (Tim Meyers 513-679-9159)

120 days after bid opening